
Bid Tally SheetJAN-21-10 04:31 PM Page 1 of 3

DISHMACHINE SUPPLIESGroup:

1

2

3

4

5

6

Itm No:

Itm No:

Itm No:

Itm No:

Itm No:

Itm No:

 Note:

 Note:

 Note:

42511

42508

42509

42507

42517

42518

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

No Bid by Sofco

No bid by Sofco

No Bid by Sofco

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

DELIMER/ LIME AWAY

DETERGENT SOAP, CAPSULES

DETERGENT SOAP, POWDER

DETERGENT SOAP, SOLID

Double Tank Conveyor Machine

Single Tank Conveyor Machine

Product:

Product:

Product:

Product:

Product:

Product:

AWARDED

AWARDED

AWARDED

AWARDED

AWARDED

AWARDED

Status:

Status:

Status:

Status:

Status:

Status:

 $8.2000

 $7.6500

 $1.4000

 $1.4000

 $0.9800

 $0.0000

 $2.2500

 $2.2959

 $126.0000

 $0.0000

Bid Price

Bid Price

Bid Price

Bid Price

Bid Price

 448

 448

 5,832

 5,832

 14,100

 14,100

 10,854

 10,854

 20

 20

Quan

Quan

Quan

Quan

Quan

Bid Status

Bid Status

Bid Status

Bid Status

Bid Status

 $3,673.60

 $3,427.20

 $8,164.80

 $8,164.80

 $13,818.00

 $0.00

 $24,421.50

 $24,920.02

 $2,520.00

 $0.00

Item Total

Item Total

Item Total

Item Total

Item Total

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Supplier

Supplier

Supplier

Supplier

Supplier

1266

Dish Machine Chemicals

Long Island School Food Service
Directors Assoc

AWARDED

15-AUG-05

14-AUG-06

02-MAY-05

01-JUN-05
01-JUN-05

02-JUN-05

02-JUN-05

Bread Bid ChairCLEANING SUPPLIES

RFP ID:

Desc:

Status:

RFP Type:

Issued By:

Bid Period Start:

Bid Period End:

Issue Date:

Due Date:

Award Date:

Scheduled Open:

Date Opened:

By:

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Ecolab Inc.

Eco Lab

Ecolab Inc.

Eco Lab

Ecolab Inc.

Ecolab Inc.

Eco Lab

GALLON

POUND

POUND

POUND

EACH

EACH

42511

42508

42509

42507

42517

42518

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

DELIMER/ LIME AWAY

DETERGENT SOAP, CAPSULES

DETERGENT SOAP, POWDER

DETERGENT SOAP, SOLID

Dishmachine

Dishmachine

1060RFP No:

Desc:

Desc:

Desc:

Desc:

Desc:

Desc:
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DISHMACHINE SUPPLIESGroup:

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

Itm No:

Itm No:

Itm No:

Itm No:

Itm No:

Itm No:

Itm No:

 Note:

42518

42512

42501

42500

42505

42504

42503

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

No Bid by Sofco

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Single Tank Conveyor Machine

GREASE AGENT

POT AND PAN SOAP, LIQUID

POT AND PAN SOAP, SOLID

RINSE AGENT, LIQUID

RINSE AGENT, SOLID

SANITIZER

Product:

Product:

Product:

Product:

Product:

Product:

Product:

AWARDED

AWARDED

AWARDED

AWARDED

AWARDED

AWARDED

AWARDED

Status:

Status:

Status:

Status:

Status:

Status:

Status:

 $229.9500

 $0.0000

 $9.0000

 $29.2350

 $9.8000

 $12.8020

 $4.8000

 $4.9250

 $15.5500

 $14.5000

 $11.8000

 $81.2500

Bid Price

Bid Price

Bid Price

Bid Price

Bid Price

Bid Price

 7

 7

 180

 180

 1,895

 1,895

 2,560

 2,560

 1,316

 1,316

 500

 500

Quan

Quan

Quan

Quan

Quan

Quan

Bid Status

Bid Status

Bid Status

Bid Status

Bid Status

Bid Status

 $1,609.65

 $0.00

 $1,620.00

 $5,262.30

 $18,571.00

 $24,259.79

 $12,288.00

 $12,608.00

 $20,463.80

 $19,082.00

 $5,900.00

 $40,625.00

Item Total

Item Total

Item Total

Item Total

Item Total

Item Total

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Supplier

Supplier

Supplier

Supplier

Supplier

Supplier

1266

Dish Machine Chemicals

Long Island School Food Service
Directors Assoc

AWARDED

15-AUG-05

14-AUG-06

02-MAY-05

01-JUN-05
01-JUN-05

02-JUN-05

02-JUN-05

Bread Bid ChairCLEANING SUPPLIES

RFP ID:

Desc:

Status:

RFP Type:

Issued By:

Bid Period Start:

Bid Period End:

Issue Date:

Due Date:

Award Date:

Scheduled Open:

Date Opened:

By:

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Ecolab Inc.

Eco Lab

Ecolab Inc.

Eco Lab

Ecolab Inc.

Eco Lab

Ecolab Inc.

Eco Lab

Ecolab Inc.

Eco Lab

EACH

GALLON

GALLON

POUND

GALLON

GALLON

1/2 GALLON

42518

42512

42501

40500

42505

42504

42503

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

GREASE AGENT

POT AND PAN SOAP, LIQUID

POT AND PAN SOAP, SOLID

RINSE AGENT, LIQUID

RINSE AGENT, SOLID

RFP No:

Desc:

Desc:

Desc:

Desc:

Desc:

Desc:
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DISHMACHINE SUPPLIESGroup:

12

13

14

15

Itm No:

Itm No:

Itm No:

Itm No:

 Note:

42503

42520

42521

42522

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

TPL SKU:

No Bid by Sofco

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

Bid Unit:

SANITIZER

DEGREASER

POT AND PAN, METAL CLEANER

LIME AWAY SPRAY

Product:

Product:

Product:

Product:

AWARDED

AWARDED

AWARDED

AWARDED

Status:

Status:

Status:

Status:

 $14.4500

 $7.8750

 $13.3300

 $36.1100

 $2.1750

 $0.0000

 $0.2365

 $0.2360

Bid Price

Bid Price

Bid Price

Bid Price

 2,024

 2,024

 42

 42

 76

 76

 29

 29

Quan

Quan

Quan

Quan

Bid Status

Bid Status

Bid Status

Bid Status

 $29,246.80

 $15,939.00

 $559.86

 $1,516.62

 $165.30

 $0.00

 $6.86

 $6.84

Item Total

Item Total

Item Total

Item Total

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Ecolab

SOFCO

Supplier

Supplier

Supplier

Supplier

1266

Dish Machine Chemicals

Long Island School Food Service
Directors Assoc

AWARDED

15-AUG-05

14-AUG-06

02-MAY-05

01-JUN-05
01-JUN-05

02-JUN-05

02-JUN-05

Bread Bid ChairCLEANING SUPPLIES

RFP ID:

Desc:

Status:

RFP Type:

Issued By:

Bid Period Start:

Bid Period End:

Issue Date:

Due Date:

Award Date:

Scheduled Open:

Date Opened:

By:

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Manufacturer

Ecolab Inc.

Eco Lab

Ecolab Inc.

Eco Lab

Eco Lab

1/2 GALLON

GALLON

POUND

OUNCE

42503

42520

42521

42522

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

Bid Item No:

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

AWARDED

REJECTED

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

No Bidders:

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

Epic Industries,Frankel Maintenance Supplies,SYSCO,Sterling Supplies,U.S. Food Service

SANITIZER

Degreaser Product Chemical

Solid Metal Pro or =

CLINGING LIME AWAY

RFP No:

Desc:

Desc:

Desc:

Desc:


